PURCHASING
DEPARTMENT

2150 Keith Bridge Road Cumming, GA 30040
Phone: 770-781-6603 Fax: 770-888-0222

FORSYTH

COUNTY SCHOOLS

Quality Learning and Superior Performance for All

December 16, 2024

Best Plumbing Specialties Inc.
3039 Ventrie Ct

Myersville, MD 21773

Attn: Amber Carr

Dear Ms. Carr:
This is to advise you that your contract BID# B21-03, Plumbing Parts & Supplies has been
awarded a renewal contract. The effective date of this contract is January 6, 2025, and

terminates on January 5, 2026.

This award is in accordance with the terms and conditions of the contract and with your attached
pricing to remain firm for the entire contract period. This award letter is not an official order.

If you have any questions about this award, please contact Trey Tryan at 770-781-6603 or

ttryan@forsyth.k12.ga.us. We appreciate your interest in the Forsyth County School System and
your participation in our bidding process.

Sincerely,

~ L D s

Brad Richardson
Director of Procurement Services



FORSYTH COUNTY SCHOOLS
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

B21-03 Plumbing Parts

Best Plumbing Specialties Inc.

FCS Item : Item Descripti_on . Unit of Your Part Manufacturer's Make and Lead Time (P::lsjtnit
Number (Including Make and Model if Applicable*) Issue Number Model (To FCSS) of Issue)

P-COPP-0800 COPPER ELBOW 1/2" X 1/2" 45 DEGREE SWEAT Each 71637 NIBCO 606 /310965 | 5-7 Business Day| $0.68
P-COPP-0801 [ COPPER ELBOW L 1/2" X 1/2" ID 90 DEGREE SWEAT Each 71630 NIBCO 607 /312723 | 5-7 Business Day| $0.39
P-COPP-0802 COPPER, TEE L 1/2" X 1/2" X 1/2" ID SWEAT Each 71634 NIBCO 611/327000 | 5-7 Business Day| $0.68
P-COPP-0803 | COPPER SWEAT 1/2" MPT X 1/2" ID MALE ADAPTER Each 71632 NIBCO 604 /303103 | 5-7 Business Day| $3.32
P-COPP-0804 [ COPPER SWEAT 1/2" FPT X 1/2" ID FEMALE ADAPTER | Each 71633 NIBCO 603 / 9024650 | 5-7 Business Day| $1.48
P-COPP-0805 COPPER.COUPLING, SWEAT 1/2" ID Each 71604 NIBCO 601/309525 [5-7 Business Day| NA

P-COPP-0806 [ COPPER, COUPLING 1/2" X 3/8" REDUCING COUPLING [ Each 71608 NIBCO 600R / 306968 | 5-7 Business Day| $2.45
P-COPP-0807 COPPER BALL VALVE 1/2" SWEAT Each 99347998 NIBCO S-FP-600A-LF | 5-7 Business Day| NA

P-COPP-0809 | COPPER ELBOW L 3/4" X 3/4" ID 45 DEGREE SWEAT Each 71645 NIBCO 606 / 311061 5-7 Business Day| $1.20
P-COPP-0810 | COPPER ELBOW L 3/4" X 3/4" ID 90 DEGREE SWEAT Each 71638 NIBCO 607 /312884 | 5-7 Business Day| $0.93
P-COPP-0811 COPPER TEE 3/4" X 3/4" X 3/4" ID SWEAT Each 71642 NIBCO 611/327680  [5-7 Business Day| NA

P-COPP-0812 COPPER TEE 3/4" X 3/4" X 1/2" Each 72075 NIBCO 611R /327741 | 5-7 Business Day| $6.21

P-COPP-0813 COPPER TEE 3/4 x 1/2 x 3/4 Each 99050333 NIBCO 611RR /327901 |5-7 Business Day| $7.63
P-COPP-0815 COPPER 3/4" 90 DEGREE STREET ELL Each 71687 NIBCO 607-2 /314086 |5-7 Business Day| $1.21

p-copp-0s16 | COPPER. ADPTS'VSVVEIIAE?L'\AASIE'IZ'D%_IY MPT X 3/4* OD Each 71640 NIBCO 607-2 /314086 |5-7 Business Day| $1.50
p-copp-0g17 | COPPER. ADPE@‘QE?;;&X/I&L'%D%? FPT X 3/4" 0D Each 71641 NIBCO 603 /301505 | 5-7 Business Day| $1.86
P-COPP-0818 COPPER COUPLING W/S 3/4 Each 71639 NIBCO 600DS /309044 |5-7 Business Day| $2.41

P-COPP-0819 COPPER REDUCING COUPLING 3/4 x 1/2" Each 71653 NIBCO 600R / 307163 | 5-7 Business Day| $4.24
P-COPP-0820 COPPER 45 DEGREE ELL 2" Each 700045 NIBCO 606 /311405 | 5-7 Business Day| $34.03
P-COPP-0821 UNION, DIELECTRIC 3/4 FPT X 3/4" SWEAT Each 99342446 | LEGEND VALVE 301-205NL| 5-7 Business Day| $5.28
P-COPP-0822 BOILER DRAINS 3/4" MIP PF75FC Each 99902769 PROFLO PF75FC 5-7 Business Day| NA

P-COPP-0823 COPPER,ELBOW, L 1" X 1" ID 45 DEGREE SWEAT Each 99252666 VIEGA 77028 5-7 Business Day| $13.10




FORSYTH COUNTY SCHOOLS
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

P-COPP-0824 | COPPER, ELBOW, L 1" X 1"ID 90 DEGREE SWEAT Each 700003 NIBCO 611 /328663 5-7 Business Day| NA

P-COPP-0825 COPPER TEE 1" Each 700032 NIBCO 611 /328182 5-7 Business Day| NA

P-COPP-0826 COPPER TEE 1 x 1 x 3/4" Each 99090003 NIBCO 611R / 328243 | 5-7 Business Day| $20.00
P-COPP-0827 COPPER,TEE, L 1" X 3/4" X 1" ID SWEAT Each 99288081 NIBCO 611RR / 328366 |5-7 Business Day| $23.79
P-COPP-0828 COPPER TEE 1" X 3/4" X 3/4" SWEAT Each 99272473 NIBCO 611RR /328380 |5-7 Business Day| $23.79
P-COPP-0829 COPPER TEE 3/4" X 3/4" X 1" Each 99382597 NIBCO 10032770 5-7 Business Day| $21.69
P-COPP-0830 COPPER ADP;—WSEVXEP;\\/I-I:A:_ENAFI,DTP%IJ ID COPPER Each 700102 NIBCO 604 / 303424 5-7 Business Day| NA

P-COPP-0831 COPPER ADPT. SWEPI;K/ILL'I:EP;D);} ID COPPER SWEAT Each 700112 NIBCO 603 / 301604 5-7 Business Day| NA

P-COPP-0832 COPPER,COUPLING, SWEAT 1" Each 700070 NIBCO 603 / 301604 5-7 Business Day| NA

P-COPP-0833 COPPER REDUCING COUPLING 1 x 3/4" Each 700011 NIBCO 600R / 307347 | 5-7 Business Day| $7.70
P-COPP-0834 BALL*’\‘/OAII\IXE,lP(S)\IiVLE)A*I_I\?(';gbLB%‘I'?II:\rE!I—'::)Z\los_gps_m Each 700486 APOLLO 70LF-205-01 |5-7 Business Day| $55.95
P-COPP-0835 DIELECTRIC UNION 1" Each 72362 | EGEND VALVE 301-105NL| 5-7 Business Day| $5.44
P-COPP-0836 COPPER, ELBOW L 1S\1I\IIAIfEA)§I'1 1/4"1D 45 DEGREE Each 99016853 VIEGA 77033 5-7 Business Day| $18.43
P-COPP-0837 COPPER, ELBOW, L 1S\J\;éA'I)'<1 1/4"1D 90 DEGREE Each 700004 NIBCO 607 / 078599 5-7 Business Day| $12.92
P-COPP-0838 COPPER TEE 1 1/4" Each 700033 NIBCO 611/ 328663 5-7 Business Day| $26.96
P-COPP-0839 COPPER ADPT. SgVV\I/EQI'IJ I\}I,/:CENJ\FI,Z)TP?.1 1/4" 1D COPPER Each 700103 NIBCO 604 / 303547 5-7 Business Day| $20.42
P-COPP-0840 | COPPER, ADPT. SWEAT 1 1/4" FPT X 1 1/4" ID FEMALE Each 700113 NIBCO 603 /301703 5-7 Business Day| $23.94
P-COPP-0841 COPPER,COUPLING -SWEAT 1 1/4" ID Each 700071 NIBCO 601 / 309624 5-7 Business Day| $10.95
P-COPP-0842 COPPER REDUCING COUPLING 1 1/4 x 1" Each 99040325 NIBCO 600R / 307484 | 5-7 Business Day| $11.59
P-COPP-0843 BALL VALVE 1 1/4" 70-206-01 **APOLLO ONLY** Each 700476 APOLLO 70LF-206-01 |5-7 Business Day| $93.86
P-COPP-0844 COPPER 45 DEGREE ELL 1 1/2" Each 700044 NIBCO 606 / 311344 5-7 Business Day| NA

P-COPP-0845 COPPER, ELBOW, L 18\1/\//?EA)'I§ 11/2"1D 90 DEGREE Each 700084 NIBCO 607-2 /314208 |5-7 Business Day| $25.79
P-COPP-0846 COPPER TEE, 1 1/2" Each 99091751 VIEGA 77037 5-7 Business Day| $34.54
P-COPP-0848 COPPER FEMALE ADAPTER 1 1/2" Each 700114 NIBCO 603 / 301802 5-7 Business Day| $37.40




FORSYTH COUNTY SCHOOLS
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

P-COPP-0849 COPPER, COUPLING, SWEAT 1 1/2" ID Each 99091754 VIEGA 78067 5-7 Business Day| $18.09
P-COPP-0850 COPPER, REDUCING COUPLING 1 1/2" X 1 1/4" Each 99040326 NOBCO 600R / 307668 |5-7 Business Day| $17.68
P-COPP-0851 | BALL VALVE 1 1/2"-SWEAT- 70-207-01**APOLLO ONLY** Each 700477 APOLLO 70LF-207-01 |5-7 Business Day| $119.86
P-cOPP-0g52 | BALL VALVE, 3/4" SWE’g,\iﬁf{T e e S =T 700475 APOLLO 70LF-204-01 [5-7 Business Day| $44.44
P-COPP-0853 [ COPPER, ELBOW, L 2" X 2"ID 90 DEGREE SWEAT Each 700006 NIBCO 607 / 078704 | 5-7 Business Day| $36.71
P-COPP-0854 COPPER TEE-2" Each 700035 NIBCO 611 /329707 |5-7 Business Day| $64.80
P-COPP-0855 COPPER, ADPT. SWEAT 2" MPT X 2" ID MALE Each 700105 NIBCO 604 / 303783 | 5-7 Business Day| $40.49
P-COPP-0856 COPPER,ADPT. SWEAT 2" FPT X 2" ID FEMALE Each 700115 NIBCO 603 /301901 | 5-7 Business Day| $50.81
P-COPP-0857 COPPER, COUPLING, SWEAT 2" ID Each 700073 NIBCO 601 /309662 |5-7 Business Day| $23.45
P-COPP-0858 COPPER REDUCING COUPLING 2" X 1 1/2" Each 88100962 NIBCO 600-R / 9002400 |5-7 Business Day| NA
P-COPP-0859 BALL VALVE 2" 70-208-01 **APOLLO ONLY** Each 700478 APOLLO 70LF-208-01 |5-7 Business Day| No Bid
P-COPP-0860 COPPER END CAP-3/4 Each 71644 NIBCO 617 /306302 |5-7 Business Day| NA
P-COPP-0861 COPPER END CAP-1/2 Each 71636 NIBCO 617 /306265 |5-7 Business Day| NA
P-PUMP-0001 R L Each 99034231 FRUNDFOS GFUPS1535SF(7-14 Business Day No Bid
GFUPS1535SFC
P-PUMP-0002 FLANG'ég'géPV’;TTTH#Tf{?éFRLLTI\I%i’ggN;TU",:A\éALVES' Each 99347422 GRUNDFOS GF34FLNG [7-14 Business Day No Bid
P-PVC-0001 PVC-ELBOW 90-PART # 9005917205- AO Smith Each 99315625 | A.O. SMITH 9007245005 |5-7 Business Day| No Bid
P-PVC-0002 4 INCH PVC SLIP FIX COUP-#SS118-40 - SPEARS Each 99902781 SPEARS SS118-40 | 5-7 Business Day| No Bid
P-PVC-0003 3 INCH PVC SLIP FIX COUP-# SS118-30 - SPEARS Each 99902782 SPEARS SS118-30 | 5-7 Business Day| No Bid
P-PVC-0004 | 2 1/2 INCH PVC SLIP FIX COUP-#SS11825 - SPEARS Each 99902783 SPEARS SS118-25 | 5-7 Business Day| No Bid
P-PVC-0005 | 2INCH PVC SLIP FIX COUP- # PF40SFCK - SPEARS Each 99902784 PROFLO PF40SFCK | 5-7 Business Day| No Bid
P-SPRK-0001 ESCUTCHEONS'V'K;'X(;';/: ()CG'ZTéZAE CIESCREGEEEN | gy 99471991 | VIKING SUPPLY 06419AF | 5-7 Business Day| No Bid
P-SPRK-0002 ESCUTCHEONS'F,TXSTc’fgg%’SQg% 2IFENEEESC Each 99345590 TYCO 567009010 5-7 Business Day| NA
P-VACU-0500 SLOAN VACUUM BREAKER REPAIR KIT #V-551-A Each 48805 SLOAN 3323192 5-7 Business Day| $2.39
P-VACU-0501 Ut S SHEFUCOY RS RURE AR Each 71583 T&S BRASS B-0968-RK01 | 5-7 Business Day| $22.28

#B-0968-RK01




FORSYTH COUNTY SCHOOLS
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

P-VACU-0502 | T & S 1/2" VACUUM BREAKER REPAIR #B-0969-RK01 Each 71584 T&S BRASS B-0969-RK01 | 5-7 Business Day| $25.34
P-VACU-0503 3/4 CHROME, WATT%:;;%SESVACUUM BREAKER Each 99061213 WATTS 0792092 5-7 Business Day| No Bid
P-VACU-0504 3/4" BRASS, WATTS :(())()Selig;gAzCUUM BREAKER NIR Each 79011 WATTS 0061982 5-7 Business Day| No Bid
KOHLER-POLISHED CHROME CHECK VALVE . .
P-VACU-0505 REBUILDING #30253-CP Each 99091363 KOHLER 30253-CP 5-7 Business Day| No Bid
P-VACU-0506 WATT'S RK 008-T 3/8x1/2" KIT #0887972 Each 99061146 WATTS 0887972 5-7 Business Day| No Bid
P-VACU-0507 | WATT'S RKO008 T 3/4" x 1" KIT #RK 008-T 3/4-1 #0887974 | Each 99061147 WATTS 0887974 5-7 Business Day| No Bid
WATT'S 3/4 x 1" BONNET ASSEMBLY KIT W/R #RK 008- . .
P-VACU-0508 B 3/4-1 #0887973 Each 99061149 WATTS 0887973 5-7 Business Day| No Bid
P-VACU-0509 WATT'S WIR 288A REZ;;Q%I;O - 3/8" #RK188288388T Each 79002 WATTS 0887170 5-7 Business Day| No Bid
P-VACU-0510 | WATT'S REGULATOR-1/2" RK 188/288/388 T #0887171 Each 79005 WATTS 0887171 5-7 Business Day| No Bid
WATT'S LEAD FREE TOTAL VALVE REPAIR KIT, RK . .
P-VACU-0511 188/288/388-T, 3/4-1 #0887172 Each 79008 WATTS 0887172 5-7 Business Day| No Bid
P-VACU-0512 WATT'S RK 008 B 3/8 - 1/2- #0888012 Each 99061148 WATTS 0888012 5-7 Business Day| No Bid
P-VACU-0513 QL Aol VACUU(')\:')Z?_?EAKER REPAIR KIT #38- Each 99272364 CONBRACO 38-104-01 | 5-7 Business Day| No Bid
P-VACU-0514 CONBRACO 3/8" & 1/2 #\ég-((:)g:‘im BREAKER REPAIR KIT Each 99044861 CONBRACO 38-003-01 |5-7 Business Day| No Bid
P-VACU-0515 1 1/4" X 8 VACUUM BREAKER TUBE *SLOAN* Each 48808 SLOAN 3301446 5-7 Business Day| $18.25
P-VACU-0516 11/2°X8 VACE,:E(’\)AA?\IR*EAKER TUBE Each 48811 SLOAN 3301447 5-7 Business Day| No Bid
P-VACU-0517 SLOAN VAC BREAKER 1 1/2" x 24 1/2"-V-500-AA Each 99101712 SLOAN 0393010 5-7 Business Day| $46.26
P-VACU-0518 SLOAN 1 1/2" x 30 1/2" VAC BREAKER V500AA Each 99063581 SLOAN 0323209 5-7 Business Day| $45.91
P-VACU-0519 SLOAN VACU BREAKER 1 1/4" x 21 1/2" Each 99314093 SLOAN 0323020 5-7 Business Day| $43.30
Watts Repair Kit WATTS 288A PLASTIC BONNET, 1/2 IN.
P-VACU-0520 Item # 350280 UNSPSC Code 47131705 Each 99062898 WATTS 1002082 5-7 Business Day| $7.03
WATTS WATER TECHNOLOGIES Part # 1002082
Watts Repair Kit WATTS 288A PLASTIC BONNET 3/4 IN.
P-VACU-0521 | Item # 350298 UNSPSC Code 40141700 WATTS WATER Each 99120449 WATTS 1002528 5-7 Business Day| $8.21
TECHNOLOGIES Part # 1002528
P-COPP-0808 COPPER 1/2" 90 DEGREE STREET ELL Each 71694 NIBCO 607-2 /314000 | 5-7 Business Day QL'J\‘o(ited




PURCHASING
DEPARTMENT

2150 Keith Bridge Road Cumming, GA 30040
Phone: 770-781-6603 Fax: 770-888-0222

FORSYTH

COUNTY SCHOOLS

Quality Learning and Superior Performance for All

December 17, 2024

TMS South

3540 Rutherford Rd
Taylors, SC 29687
Attn: Fraser Tabb

Dear Ms. Tabb:

This is to advise you that your company has been awarded a renewal contract from our BID#
B21-03, Plumbing Parts & Supplies. The effective date of this contract is January 6, 2025 and
terminates on January 5, 2026.

This award is in accordance with the original terms and conditions of the contract and with your
attached pricing to remain firm for the entire contract period. This award letter is not an official
order.

If you have any questions about this award, please contact Trey Tryan at 770-781-6603 or
ttryan@forsyth.k12.ga.us. We appreciate your interest in the Forsyth County School System and
your participation in our bidding process.

Sincerely,

- D s

Brad Richardson
Director of Procurement Services



B21-03 Plumbing Parts

TMS SOUTH

Cost
I:ijsn:;il:l (nclcing :;:;: :-.eds;;z::l;:pp"‘ab'e*) Unit of Issue Your Part Number Manufacturer's Make and Model (PeI;:ur:; of
P-BRAD-0001 [BRADLEY WASHER REPAIR KIT FOR HAND SINK
S65-074-PART # 0044990 Each 40129033 $132.00
BRADLEY S65--074
P-BRAD-0002 TUBING 1/4", RED R68-60001-R
PER FOOT R68-6000-11-R $1.03
BRADLEY R68-6000-11-R
P-BRAD-0003 TUBING 1/4", GREEN R68-60001-G
PER FOOT R68-6000-11-G $1.03
BRADLEY R68-6000-11-G
P-BRAD-0004 TUBING 1/4", BLACK R68-60001-B
PER FOOT R68-6000-11-B $1.03
BRADLEY R68-6000-11-B
P-BRAD-0005 TUBING 1/4", YELLOW R68-60001-Y
PER FOOT R68-6000-11-Y $1.03
BRADLEY R68-6000-11-Y
P-BRAD-0006 BRADLEY DIAPHRAGM 269-983
Each 41021193 $6.95
BRADLEY 269-983
P-BRAD-0007 SWITCH TOUCHTIME S83-443
Each $83-443 $325.39
BRADLEY S83-443
P-BUBB-0001 1/4" JG SHUT OFF VALVE
Each 40901101 $5.72
John Guest PPSV04080WX
P-BUBB-0002 3/8" JG SHUT-OFF VALVE
Each 40901102 $6.92
John Guest PPSV041212WP
P-CLOS-0200 COMP CLOSET FLANGE 4", COMPRESSION CLOSET FLANGE-
BriColEGHIE0 Each 40210016 $16.89
BRUCO GH 950P
P-CLOS-0201 BRASS CLOSET FLANGE DIA 4"; THICKNESS 9/16
Each C-121-01 $33.15
Prier Products C-121-01
P-CLOS-0202 CLOSET BOLT 5/16" x 2 (2 bolts in a pack)
Each 40210013 $3.42
Gene Rich & C0.26-TP
P-CLOS-0203 SPANNER FLANGE
Each 40211339 $3.63
Lordani TF-1
P-CLOS-0204 FLAPPER BALL 54BP - KORKY
Each 40218001 $2.58
Lavelle Ind. 54BP
P-CLOS-0205 FLUIDMASTER BALLCOCK-PART # 400A
Each 4044464 $10.04
Fluidmaster 400A
P-CLOS-0206 WAX TOILET GASKET BLACK SWAN 8015400
Each 40211016 $1.15
Black Swan 8015400
P-CLOS-0207 SLOAN TRAP PRIMER ASSEMBLY MODEL NUMBER VBF72A1
Each 91785560 $73.24
SLOAN 3396075, VBF-72-A1
P-CLOS-0208 [ZURN- TOILET SEAT, EXTRA HEAVY DUTY,ELONGATED,
STANDARD WHITE, OPEN FRONT TOILET SEAT, LESS Each Z5956SS-EL-STS $37.42
COVER WITH STAINLESS STEEL CHECK HINGE.Z5956SS- ZURN Z5956SS-EL-STS
P-CLOS-0210  [REPAIR KIT #2 SLOAN 1.5 - A-37-A
Each 40261037 $16.55
SLOAN A-37-A
P-CLOS-0211 FLUSH VALVE ASSEMBLY TOILET 1.6 SLOAN #111
XL/CHROME Each 40265178 $107.90
SLOAN 3080053, #111
P-CLOS-0212  [SLOAN WATER CLOSET FLUSHOMETER REPAIR KIT 4.5 -
A-36-A Each 40260004 $16.51
SLOAN A-36-A
P-CLOS-0213 [CONTROL STOP, FLUSH VALVE 3/4" SCREW DRIVER
CONTROL STOP REPAIR KIT SLOAN #H-543-ASD Each 40261085 $10.68
SLOAN 3308856
P-CLOS-0214 [CONTROL STOP, FLUSH VALVE SLOAN CONTROL STOP
REPAIR PARTS 1" SLOAN #H-541-ASD Each 40201009 $10.68
SLOAN H-541-ASD
P-CLOS-0215  [SLOAN HANDLE REPAIR KIT B-50-A FOR B-32-A HANDLE
ASSEMBLY - 5302305 Each 40262305 $2.69
SLOAN B-50-A
P-CLOS-0216  [SLOAN DIAPHRAGM-A-156-A
Each 40261161 $5.00

SLOAN A-156-A




P-CLOS-0218

DELANY DIAPHRAGM F141KC

Each 40221026 $14.34
DELANY F-141-KC
P-CLOS-0249  [SLOAN S/V INSIDE COVER-A-71
Each 40261124 $5.97
SLOAN A-71
P-CLOS-0250 |RUBBER/SPONGE URINAL WASHER
Each 40210042 $2.02
The Part Works 30434
P-CLOS-0949 [CLOSET SPUD 11/2 x11/2
Each 40210959 $7.26
CSB International CS 150150
P-CLOS-0951 CLOSET SPUD 11/4 X 1 1/4
Each 40210960 $5.77
CSB International CS 125125
P-CLOS-0952  [SLOAN ADJ. -TLPC O RINGS #42
Each 40950069 $0.18
Sterling Seal & Supply 123-7470
P-CLOS-0953 [SLOAN HANDLE SOCKET ASSEMBLY-B7A
Each 40262109 $5.89
SLOAN 0302109, B-7-A
P-CLOS-0954  [PLASTIC NYLON,TOILET BOLTS-2 PER PACK, WHITE, 425-
PB - PLUMB PERFECT Each 40210150 $1.05
SIOUX CHIEF 425-PB
P-DRAI-0100 1 1/4" P TRAP WITH CLEANOUT CHROME **WATTS**
Each 40800011 $21.24
CSB International 13BDCP-WB
P-DRAI-0101 11/2" P TRAP WITHOUT CLEANOUT CHROME
Each 40800006 $20.49
CSB International 15BDCP-WB
P-DRAI-0103 1 1/4" LAV GRIND DRAIN
Each 40800167 $11.99
CSB International 3700-6CP
P-DRAI-0104 1 1/4" SJ TAILPIECE,CHROME FINISH- 1PNT917GA 6"
LONG Each 40800056 $8.29
CSB International 4808-6BCP
P-DRAI-0105 1 1/2 X6 FLANGE TAIL PIECE, CHROME FINISH
Each 3812-6CP $5.03
CSB International 3812-6CP
P-DRAI-0106 11/2" SJ TAILPIECE, CHROME FINISH, 161132 8" LONG
Each 3809-8CP $7.89
CSB International 3809-8CP
P-DRAI-0107 BASKET STRAINER, STAINLESS STEEL. 1 1/2-PART #8040
Each 40800465 $2.08
CSB International 20726SS
P-DRAI-0108 2" BRASS CLEANOUT PLUG MPT
RECESSED-USED ON FLOORS Each 40800179 $3.67
Pasco 1853
P-DRAI-0109 2 1/2 BRASS CLEANOUT PLUG MPT
RECESSED-USED ON FLOORS-P51-250 Each 40800181 $5.04
Pasco 1854
P-DRAI-0110 3"BRASS PLUG-RECESSED-USED ON FLOORS-#P51-300
Each 40800183 $6.49
Pasco 1855
P-DRAI-0111 BRASS PLUG 3 1/2"-RECESSED-USED ON FLOORS P51-
350 Each 40800185 $7.90
Pasco 1856
P-DRAI-0112 BRASS PLUG 4" RECESSED-USED ON FLOORS P51-400
Each 40800187 $9.95
Pasco 1857
P-DRAI-0114 6" BRASS PLUG-RECESSED-USED ON FLOORS-# P51-600
Each 40800191 $22.29
Pasco 1879
P-DRAI-0115 FLANGE TAILPIECE 1 1/2 OD TUBE X 12"/CHROME
Each 40800047 $10.28
CSB International 4812-12CP
P-DRAI-0116 2' BRASS CLEAN OUT PLUG-RAISED-USED ON WALLS
Each 40800173 $3.89
Jones Stephens P50-200
P-DRAI-0117 2 1/2"' BRASS CLEAN OUT PLUG-RAISED-USED ON WALLS
Each 40800180 $4.45
Pasco 1848
P-DRAI-0118 3'BRASS CLEAN OUT PLUG-RAISED-USED ON WALLS
Each 40800182 $6.15
Pasco 1849
P-DRAI-0119 3 1/2 " BRASS CLEAN OUT PLUG-RAISED-USED ON
WALLS. P50-350 Each 40800184 $7.75

Pasco 1850




P-DRAI-0120

4" BRASS CLEAN OUT PLUG-RAISED-USED ON WALLS

Each 40800186 $9.38
Pasco 1851
P-DRAI-0122 6 " BRASS CLEAN OUT PLUG-RAISED-USED ON WALLS
Each 40800190 $22.49
Pasco 1876
P-DRAI-0123 GASKET FOR KITCHEN DRAINS-3 ' PART # 211177
Each 40800635 $1.99
Component Hardware D10-X009
P-DRAI-0124 GASKET FOR KITCHEN DRAINS-3 1/2 '-PART # 211359
Each 40800337 $1.91
Lordhal Engiineering SSA-1K-2
P-DRAI-0125 #7531 EVERFLOW SINK STRAINER BASKET, LONG
SHANK, 304 STAINLESS STEEL BASKET, 3/12"-4"OPENING, Each 40800159 $12.09
4/12 FLANGE CSB International 768BSS-2BN
P-EBCO-0001 [OASIS PSAM WATER COOLER BUBBLER NOZZEL
ASSEMBLEY-PART # OA 30029-005 Each 40700015 $56.39
OASIS 30029-005-SP
P-ELKY-0001 ELKAY PUSH BAR-FRONT & SIDE PUSH-ENTIRE ASSY .-
#E56229C Each 40700183 $78.54
ELKAY E56229C
P-ELKY-0002 ELKAY CARTRIDGE ASSY. FOR WATER COOLER-
REGULATOR KIT- #92450C -(REGULATOR HOLDER) Each 38290887 $26.85
ELKAY 92450C
P-ELKY-0003 ELKAY FRONT PUSH BAR-#10000016000 (PACKS OF TWO)
Each 38295999 $25.75
ELKAY 10000016000
P-ELKY-0004 ELKAY SIDE PUSH BAR-#98537C
Each 40700057 $33.56
ELKAY 98537C
P-ELKY-0005 SOLENOID VALVE FOR ELKY WATER COOLERS-1/4 X 1/4-
PART 35981C Each 40700078 $80.56
ELKAY 35981C
P-FAUC-0300 [KITCHEN FAUCET WITH SPRAY, 8" CENTER, CHROME
FINISH Each 40100193 $47.00
Kingston Brass KB112
P-FAUC-0301 FAUCET- CENTRAL BRASS- CHROME FINISH SINGLE
HANDLE FAUCET-(0239-P) Each 0239-P $35.20
Central Brass 0239-P
P-FAUC-0302 CHICAGO FAUCET SOFTFLO AERATOR ASSEMBLY #E12JKABCP
Each 3150115 $16.67
CHICAGO E12JKABCP
P-FAUC-0303 PEDAL VALVES- CONTROLLER 9401 NON-LATCHING- 1/2" 9401-B
Each 9401-NL-1/2" FIr.Mt $698.85
Pedal VIv Ctr'l 9401 Non-Latching
P-FAUC-0304 PEDAL VALVES- CONTROLLER 9401 LATCHING 9401-A
Each 9401-L-1/2" FIr.Mt $698.85
Pedal VIv Ctr'l 9401 Latching
P-FAUC-0305 [T & S 44" SS PRE RINSE HOSE- B-0044-H
Each 40160040 $61.95
T &S BRASS B-0044-H
P-FAUC-0306 [T & S SPRAY VALVE- # B-0107
Each 40190038 $62.42
T &S BRASS B-0107
P-FAUC-0307 [T & S REPAIR KIT #B-10K
Each 40160105 $15.35
T &S BRASS B-10K
P-FAUC-0308 [T & S 68" SS PRE RINSE HOSE DIM-B68
Each 40160106 $94.64
T &S BRASS B-008-H
P-FAUC-0309 [T & S PRE-RINSE SPRING 000888-45
Each 40160042 $20.95
TMS SOUTH 119022
P-FAUC-0310 [CHICAGO FAUCETS PUSH HANDLE - 665-PSHJKCP
Each 40120176 $23.62
Chicago 665-PSHJKCP
P-FAUC-0311 DRINKING FAUCET-CENTRAL BRASS CHROME MALE
DRINKING FAUCET 1/2 " LEFT HAND-CENTRAL #0364-L Each 40100037 $114.64
Central Brass 0364-L
P-FAUC-0312
ZURN AQUASPEC SINGLE CONTROL FAUCET Z81000-XL Each Z810000-XL $117.95
ZURN Z810000-XL
P-FAUC-0313  [ZURN METERTING CARTRIDGE (POPPET) ASSY. G61754
Each 40160178 $28.62
ZURN G61754
P-FAUC-0314  [ZURN-METERING HANDLE NUT ASSEMBLY #G60561.
Each 40291054 $11.84

ZURN G60561




P-FAUC-0315

T/S SQUEEZE VALVE HANDLE PART # 001120-45M

Each 40160133 $20.78
T & S BRASS 001120-45M
P-FAUC-0316  |[DELTA SINGLE HAND FAUCET WITHOUT THE SPRAY- 120
LF Each 120-LF $123.29
DELTA 120-LF
P-FAUC-0317  [REPAIR KIT FOR HYDRANT F/ 5509 HPRK-7
JAY R SMITH MFG. CO. Each 40300018 $93.85
Jay R Smith HPRK-7
P-FAUC-0318  [VACUUM BREAKER KIT FOR HYDRANTS
HPRK-7VB JAY SMITH MFG. CO. Each 40300204 $52.49
Jay R Smith HPRK-7VB
P-FAUC-0319 [T &S -ASM-HANDLE FOR A HOSE REEL T&S 002881-40M
Each 18862881 $28.53
T & S BRASS 002881-40M
P-FAUC-0320 T&S QUICK CONNECT JET SPRAY B-1422
Each B-1422 $35.59
T & S BRASS B-1422
P-FAUC-0321 [T & S METERING CARTRIDGE BLANK-238AB
Each 40160114 $89.00
T & S BRASS 238AB
P-FAUC-0322 [BRADLEY-METERING VALVE REPAIR KIT-PART # S65-116
Each 40120011 $128.92
BRADLEY S65-116
P-FAUC-0323 |SPEAKMAN-METERING MOUNTING-SPEAKMAN'S
#G05-0441-PRP Each 40151416 $125.59
Speakman G05-0441-RPR
P-FAUC-0324 [SPEAKMAN-HOT PUSH BUTTON ASSY-SPEAKMAN
# RFG11-0043-PC Each RPG11-0032-PC $44.00
Speakman RPG11-0032-PC
P-FAUC-0325 |SPEAKMAN-COLD-PUSH BITTON ASSY SPEAKMAN
#RP611-0033-PC Each RPG11-0033-PC $44.00
Speakman RPG11-0033-PC
P-FAUC-0326 [T & S-PUSH BUTTON LAVATORY FAUCET, 1/2" NPT MALE
SHANK # B-0805 Each 40160322 $139.84
T & S BRASS B-0805
P-FAUC-0327 |BUBBLER-EBCO-FOR AN OASIS WATER COOLER- PART #
030774-006 Each 40700012 $139.34
OASIS 030774-006
P-FAUC-0328 [FOOT PEDAL BRAND- CARTRIDGE / STEM-PART # VC-991
Each 40122150 $52.29
PEDAL VALVE VC-991
P-FAUC-0329 |[FAUCET HOLE COVERS-P/G-SIZE- 1 3 /4- 8058
Each 40110181 $1.10
PASCO 1275
P-FAUC-0330 [AERATOR-DUAL 15/16 .05 GPM-
Each 40110427 $1.61
NEOPERL 50 1260 5
P-FAUC-0331 [PUSH BUTTON FOR PEDAL VALVE WITH" C" CLAMP
Each BB $16.25
PEDAL VALVE TBB
P-FAUC-0333 [ACORN METERING SERVOMOTOR ASSY.
Each 41011094 $108.35
ACORN ENG. 2563-020-002
P-FAUC-0334 [LATCHING FOOT PEDAL-# PAL1
Each PA-L1 $79.60
PEDAL VALVE PAWL1
P-FAUC-0335 [NON-LATCHING FOOT PEDAL-# PAWOL1
Each PAWOL1 $75.99
PEDAL VALVE PANL
P-FAUC-0337 |SPEAKMAN LONG COLD 3-9/16" CERAMIC CARTRIDGE
RPG05-0606 Each 3131283 $24.99
SPEAKMAN RPG05-0606
P-FAUC-0338 [SPEAKMAN SHORT COLD CERAMIC CARTRIDGE RPGO05-
0533 Each 40170030 $25.00
SPEAKMAN RPG05-0533
P-FAUC-0339 |SPEAKMAN LONG HOT 3-9/16" CERAMIC CARTRIDGE
RPG05-0605 Each 3131282 $25.45
SPEAKMAN RPG05-0605
P-FAUC-0340 [SPEAKMAN SHORT HOT CERAMIC CARTRIDGE RPG05-
0532 Each 40171009 $23.00
SPEAKMAN RPG05-0532
P-FAUC-0341 [ZURN CARTRIDGE ASSEMBLY-# 713358
Each G66686 $35.65
ZURN G66086
P-FAUC-0342 [CHICAGO FAUCETS-SINGLE FAUCET METERING
CHROME PLATE-333-E2805-665PSHAB- Each 665P5HAB $236.16

Chicago 333-E2805-665P5HAB




P-FAUC-0343

CHICAGO METERING VALVE UNIT-NO FINISH-671-

XJKABNF//W0919 Each 40120051 $34.69
Chicago 671-XJKABNF/W0919
P-FAUC-0344  |ZURN CARTRIDGE ASSY FOR Z81000-XL SINGLE
CONTROL FAUCET 92842001 Each 40291066 $16.73
ZURN 92842001
P-GASS-0400 [T & S LAB TURRET,TAPERED, WITH DOUBLE 90 DEGREE
HOSE COCK NG -BL 4200-0 Each 18860215 $126.94
T & S BRASS BL-4200-0
P-GASS-0401 |T & S GROUND KEY HOSECOCK # BL 4000-01
Each 18860209 $44.53
T & S BRASS BL-4000-01
P-GASS-0402 |T & S LAB TURRET, TAPERED WITH ONE HOSE COCK
BL 4200-01 Each 18860214 $95.38
T & S BRASS BL-4200-01
P-HOSE-0001 |REEL CRAFT -HOSE ONLY FOR REEL -1/4 X 1/4 NPTF
PART # S601013-35 Each S601013-35 $53.42
REEL CRAFT S601013-35
P-HOSE-0002 |REEL CRAFT HOSE REEL-COMPLETE HOSE AND REEL-
3/8 X 35 FT-5635 OLP Each 56350LP $357.90
REEL CRAFT FT-5635 OLP
P-HOSE-0003 REEL CRAFT 50' HOSE (ONLY) 3/8 X 50' 200 PSI
Each S601013-50 $97.00
REEL CRAFT S601013-50
P-HOSE-0004 REELCRAFT HOSE AND REEL 50' X 3/8" 5650 OLP
Each 5650 OLP $419.08
REEL CRAFT 5650 OLP
P-MISC-0001 CLEANER, CPVC PVC ABS, 16 OZ CAN CLEANER
**OATEY #30795**NO SUBSTITUTIONS** Each 60500127 $10.70
OATEY 30795
P-MISC-0002 SWITCH, BLOWER PROVER, NORMALLY OPEN, AO
SMITH NEW #100111056 Each 90201535 $87.80
AO SMITH 100111056
P-MISC-0004 CEMENT. PVC OATEY RAIN R SHINE CEMENT PVC BLUE:
1PT. **NO SUBSTITUTE*™* Each 93371027 $15.53
OATEY 30893
P-MISC-0005 TEFLON THREAD PASTE - HARVEY'S 023045 1/2 PT
Each 60501002 $15.00
Rectroseal 23551
P-MISC-0006 PUTTY, PLUMBERS 14 OZ CAN
Each 60500105 $2.45
TMS 16-105M
P-MISC-0007 O RING KIT RUBBER,- 560196,POR62 30 SIZES, 30 PIECES
Each 40950113 Lavelle POR72 RPM PRODUCTS R- $48.00
60
P-MISC-0008 WASHER KIT- RUBBER
Each J40161 $29.78
Jones Stephens J40161
P-MISC-0009 GRAPHITE PACKING- T60-0005-PLUMBEST
Each 60400108 $3.55
Monroe Hardware 49002
P-MISC-0010 STEM GREASE-"LUBE IN A TUBE 2 OZ
Each 60800013 $2.26
BLCK SWAN 4100
P-MISC-0011 CAULK, KWIK SEAL,WHITE 5.5 0Z
Each 1407080 LANCASTER (MERIT) $2.79
070798180017 KWIK SEAL 1407080
P-MISC-0012 SAND CLOTH, TOLL OPEN MESH WATER PROOF WIDTH
1 1/; LENGTH 10 YDS; GRIT 180 CLEAN FIT PART Each 60550007 TMS 51633 DIVERSITECH CORP $13.71
#0OM10124 SCM-10
P-MISC-0013 PLUMBERS HEAT PROOF GREASE-GR-1 2.5 0Z
Each 60500132 $4.06
RPM Products 80346 RSC-GR1
P-MISC-0014 SOLDER 50/50- WS 10098 1 LB
Each 60500014 $23.75
The Harris Product Group 505061
P-MISC-0015 ACID BRUSHES 3/8" FLUSH BRUSH
Each 60300009 Gene Rich 804 Jones Stephens $0.30
B29700
P-MISC-0016 SOLDER 95/5 LEAD FREE 331760
Each 60500013 $26.50
Harris Product Group 95561
P-MISC-0017 SOLDING FLUX 22107//8 OZ
Each 60550215 $8.93
TMS 14-215T
P-MISC-0019 CAUTION TAPE -- YELLOW-3" X 1000’
Roll J43310 $24.60

Jones Stephens J43310




P-MISC-0020

DRAIN JET 1 1/2" #10-2001

Each 40811008 $46.57
Peterson Products 102-001
P-MISC-0021 DRAIN JET 2 1/2" #10-2002
Each 40811005 $68.02
Peterson Products 102-1003
P-MISC-0022 DRAIN JET 4 #10-2004
Each 40811004 $81.99
Peterson Products 102-004
P-MISC-0023 DRAIN JET 6
Each 40811006 $114.47
Peterson Products 102-006
P-MISC-0024 FOUR WAY KEY- #RAP50105
Each 20200004 $3.34
The Part Works 10300
P-MISC-0025 HOSE WASHER 6
Each 40350103 Lavelle Ind. 901H Jones Stephens $0.80
G20-057 PASCO 2224
P-MISC-0026 3/4" HOSE END CAP BRASS 41
Each 40350084 CBM Luninance PH-1-C-W $1.31
MIDLAND METAL 36103
P-MISC-0027 SJ 1 1/4" RUBBER WASHER
Each 40950107 $0.20
Pasco Spec & Mfg. 2209 Lavelle 711 |
P-MISC-0028 SJ 1 1/4" POLY WASHER BEVELED
Each 40950003 Blumenthal Brand Integrated RPM $0.24
Products W-124
P-MISC-0029 SLIP JOINT NUT 1 1/4 #161001/CHROME FINISH
Each 40800034 $1.33
CSB International 547BCPLW
P-MISC-0030 SLIP JOINT 1 1/2" RUBBER WASHER
Each 40950008 $0.18
Lavelle 712 RPM PRODUCTS W-305
P-MISC-0031 SJ 1 1/2" POLY WASHER
Each 40950004 $0.18
RPM Products W-572P
P-MISC-0032 1 1/2 FLANGED POLY TAILPIECE GASKET
Each 40950135 $0.69
RPM Products W-204
P-MISC-0033 SLIP JOINT NUT 1 1/2 X1 1/2 -CHROME FINISH
Each 40800033 $0.99
CSB International 550CDPLW
P-MISC-0034 BALL TYPE PLUNGER #RPM C-17A
Each 20100162 $9.13
RPM Products C-17A
P-MISC-0036 SHOWER HEAD-CHROME, PROPLUS 194226
Each 40520074 $2.65
SUNCRAFT S180
P-MISC-0037 MULE-KICK DOUBLE DUTY DRAIN OPENER - SULFURIC ACID
CASE ONLY - 12/CASE MOTOR FREIGHT ONLY - CASE ONLY - Sl 60801010 Pass
UTILITY 25-1011T
P-MISC-0038 ZURN WATER KEY
Each 20200140 $1.76
ZURN P130 SUNCRAFT 12042
P-MISC-0039 URINAL AUGER TV4
Each 20100085 $88.78
RIDGE TOOL 46683
P-MISC-0040 CLOSET AUGER-GENERAL-6 INCH TELETUBE-ORANGE
#T6FL Each 20100056 $76.32
GENERAL WIRE T6FL 20160/IT6FL
P-MISC-0041 MASTER PLUNGER-PART #MP100-1
Each 20100010 $9.13
GT WATER MP100-1
P-MISC-0042 1/2 1D WIRE FITTING BRUSH -5/8" OD/STAINLESS STEEL
Each 20200180 $1.85
Johnson Abrasive 52903
P-MISC-0043 3/4"ID -7/8"WIRE FITTING BRUSH/ STAINLESS STEEL
Each 20300368 $1.79
Johnson Abrasive 52904
P-MISC-0044 1"ID X 1 1/8 OD WIRE FITTING BRUSH/ STAINLESS STEEL
Each 20300374 $1.79
Johnson Abrasive 31329
P-MISC-0045 11/4 1D X 1 3/8 WIRE FITTING BRUSH
STAINLESS STEEL Each 20200143 $1.89
Johnson Abrasive 52906
P-MISC-0046 11/2 WIRE BRUSH
Each 20200144 $2.45

Johnson Abrasive 812




P-MISC-0047 FAUCET SEAT KIT
Each B40000 $199.80
Jones Stephens B40000
P-MISC-0048 RECTORSEAL #5 -- 16 OZ
Pint 60500011 $21.43
RECTORSEAL 25431
P-MISC-0050 CEMENT. PVC 1/2 PT. CAN PVC CEMENT HEAVY DUTY
CLEAR OATEY #30863 16 OZ Each 93372023 $14.25
OATEY 30876
P-MISC-0051 G-TEK MAXIFLEX GLOVES-LARGE 34-874L
Pair 60300170 $5.30
G-Tek 34-874L
P-MISC-0052 G-TEK MAXIFLEX GLOVES-EXTRA LARGE 34-874XL
Pair 60300185 $5.45
G-Tek 34-874IXL
P-MISC-0053 G-TEK MAXIFLEX GLOVES-MEDIUM 34-874M
Pair 60300175 $5.10
G-Tek 34-874M,
P-MISC-0055 GLOVES, ALL PURPOSE LEATHER PALM WITH SAFETY
CUFF , PLUMBEST G50-204 -SIZE LARGE MEN'S PK OF 12 Pair G50-204 $5.60
Jones Stephens G50-204
P-MISC-0058 LEAD FREE CARTRIDGE REGULATOR FOR WATER
COOLER-PROP FLOW (400)-METAL ONLY**NO PLASTIC** Each 40700185 $17.75
Tom Tomlinson 14019436
P-MISC-0059 1514 EVER PRIME WATERLESS DRAIN TRAP LIQUID FOR
DRIED OUT DRAINS #1514//QUART Quart 60800105 $26.32
Waterless Co. 1514
P-MISC-0062 EAR PLUGS WITH CORD ( BAGS OF 100)
Bag E8500 $65.80
Jones Stephens E8500
P-MISC-0063 FOOD GRADE SILICONE MULTI-PURPOSE LUBRICANT-
SPRAY CAN 15 FL. OZ. CRC #03039 Each G1171457 $30.00
CRC INDUSTRIES G1171457
P-MISC-0065 GLOVES-RUBBER-USED FOR WORKING WITH
CHEMICALS. SIZE XL/ATLAS KV 660 Pair KV660 $71.43
ATLAS KV660, 12 PR/PACK
P-MISC-0066 KEY-D OVAL ON LANYARD-THESE GO TO PRIER
HYDRANTS- PRIER C-108KT-808 Each 64751015 $10.15
PRIER C-108KT-808
P-MISC-0067 PROVER INLET SWITCH-AO SMITH #9006288015
Each 100111064 $75.29
AO SMITH 9006280015
P-MISC-0068 WATERLESS URINAL REPLACEMENT BLUESEAL-WU-1740
- SLOAN Gallon 40540022 SLOAN WU-1740 WATERLESS $84.30
1011
P-MISC-0069 PROVER SWITCH-BLOCKED OUTLET-AO SMITH
#9006289015 Each 9006289015 $72.63
AO SMITH 9006289015
P-MISC-0952 TEFLON TAPE 1/2" PRE THREAD SEAL
Each 60507500 $1.00
BLACK SWAN 02095 G17121
P-MISC-0953 RECTORSEAL-TRU-BLUVIBRATION RESISTANT PIPE
THREAD SEALANT 8 OZ. Each 31551 $16.15
RECTORSEAL 31551
P-MISC-0954 VSRF0400-90 SEC. SWITCH FOR FIRE RISER - VIKING
Each VSRF0400 $204.05
VIKING, VSRF0400
P-MISC-0955 GAS VALVE GREASE 2.50Z - HYHEET GRAPHITE GREASE
Each VA126 Pass
HyHeet, VA126
P-MISC-0956 THREAD CUTTING OIL FOR THREAD MACHINE 26 OZ
Each 70835 $39.50
RIGID 70835
P-MISC-0959 G-TEK MAXIFLEX GLOVES - XXL
Each 34-674-XXL $93.16
GTEK 34-874-XXL, 12PR/BOX
P-PROP-0901 [PROPRESS 1/2" 90 DEGREE ELL #77317
Each 48077317 $2.63
77317 VIEGA
P-PROP-0902 (PROPRESS 1/2 X 1/2 X 1/2 TEE # 77377
Each 48077377 $3.75
77377 VIEGA
P-PROP-0903 (PROPRESS 1/2" COUPLING WITH STOP-# 78047
Each 48078047 $2.45
78047 VIEGA
P-PROP-0904 [PROPRESS 1/2" MALE ADAPTER
Each 48079215 $3.15

79215 VIEGA




P-PROP-0905

PROPRESS 1/2" FEMALE ADAPTER #79300

Each 48079300 $3.59
79300 VIEGA
P-PROP-0906 |PROPRESS 3/4" 45 DEGREE ELL #77023
Each 48077612 $3.73
77023 VIEGA
P-PROP-0907 |[PROPRESS 3/4" 90 DEGREE ELL #77022
Each 48077022 $4.05
77022 VIEGA
P-PROP-0908 |PROPRESS 3/4 X 3/4 X 3/4" TEE #77387
Each 48077387 $7.01
77387 VIEGA
P-PROP-0909 (PROPRESS 3/4" COUPLING WITH STOP- #78052
Each 48078052 $3.75
78052 VIEGA
P-PROP-0910 |PROPRESS 3/4" MALE ADAPTER- #79230
Each 48079230 $5.68
79230 VIEGA
P-PROP-0911  [PROPRESS 3/4" FEMALE ADAPTER #79315
Each 48079315 $6.14
79315 VIEGA
P-PROP-0912 |PROPRESS 1" 45 DEGREE ELL #77028
Each 48077617 $11.87
77028 VIEGA
P-PROP-0913 [PROPRESS 1" 90 DEGREE ELL #77027
Each 48077327 $8.43
77027 VIEGA
P-PROP-0914  |PROPRESS 1" X 1" X 1" TEE= #77412
Each 48077388 $12.80
77412 VIEGA
P-PROP-0915 [PROPRESS 1" COUPLING WITH STOP #78057
Each 48078057 $7.45
78057 VIEGA
P-PROP-0916 |PROPRESS 1" COUPLING WITHOUT STOP #CC-410/78182
Each 48078182 $9.75
78182 VIEGA
P-PROP-0917 |PROPRESS 1" X 3/4" COUPLING #78152
Each 48078152 $12.63
78152 VIEGA
P-PROP-0918 |PROPRESS 1" MALE ADAPTER- # 77842
Each 48079245 $10.25
79245 VIEGA
P-PROP-0919  [PROPRESS 1" FEMALE ADAPTER
Each 48079330 $11.70
79330 VIEGA
P-PROP-0920 |PROPRESS 1 1/4" 45 DEGREE ELL #77063
Each 48077624 $17.01
77063 VIEGA
P-PROP-0921 [PROPRESS 1 1/4" 90 DEGREE ELL #77032
Each 48077332 $17.01
77032 VIEGA
P-PROP-0922 |PROPRESS 1 1/4" X 1 1/4" X 1 1/4" TEE #77442
Each 77442 $21.82
77442 VIEGA
P-PROP-0923 [PROPRESS 1 1/4" COUPLING WITH STOP #78062
Each 48078062 $8.65
78062 VIEGA
P-PROP-0924 |PROPRESS 1 1/4" COUPLING WITHOUT STOP #78187
Each 48078187 $14.97
78187 VIEGA
P-PROP-0925 |[PROPRESS 1 1/4" x 1" COUPLING #78157
Each 48078154 $19.06
78157 VIEGA
P-PROP-0926 |PROPRESS 1 1/4" MALE ADAPTER #79260
Each 48079260 $20.69
79260 VIEGA
P-PROP-0927 |PROPRESS 1 1/4" FEMALE ADAPTER #79350
Each 48077454 $24.64
79350 VIEGA
P-PROP-0930 |PROPRESS 1 1/2" 45 DEGREE ELL #77038
Each 77038 $26.22
77038 VIEGA
P-PROP-0931 [PROPRESS 1 1/2 90 DEGREE ELL #77037
Each 48077337 $35.00
77037 VIEGA
P-PROP-0932 |PROPRESS 1 1/2" X 1 1/2" X 1 1/2" TEE #77457
Each 77457 $41.03

77457 VIEGA




P-PROP-0933

PROPRESS 1 1/2 COUPLING WITH STOP # 78067

Each 48078067 $16.05
78067 VIEGA
P-PROP-0934 [PROPRESS 1 1/2 COUPLING WITHOUT STOP # 78192
Each 48078192 $23.09
78192 VIEGA
P-PROP-0935 [PROPRESS 1 1/2 X 1 1/4 COUPLING #78162
Each 78162 $27.50
78162 VIEGA
P-PROP-0936 [PROPRESS 1 1/2 MALE ADAPTER-# 79275
Each 48079275 $30.14
79275 VIEGA
P-PROP-0937 [(PROPRESS 1 1/2 FEMALE ADAPTER #79365
Each 48077456 $36.53
79365 VIEGA
P-PROP-0940 [PROPRESS 2" 45 DEGREE ELL #77043
Each 77043 .38.51
77043 VIEGA
P-PROP-0941 [PROPRESS 2" 90 DEGREE ELL- # 77342
Each 48077342 $45.57
77342 VIEGA
P-PROP-0942 [(PROPRESS 2 X2 X2 TEE #77477
Each 77477 $49.45
77477 VIEGA
P-PROP-0943 [PROPRESS 2" COUPLING WITH STOP # 78072
Each 48078072 $21.68
78072 VIEGA
P-PROP-0944 |[PROPRESS 2" COUPLING WITH OUT STOP- # 78197
Each 48078197 $25.85
78197 VIEGA
P-PROP-0945 [PROPRESS 2" X 1 1/2" COUPLING-# 78167
Each 48078157 $31.55
78167 VIEGA
P-PROP-0946 |PROPRESS 2" MALE ADAPTER-# 79290
Each 48079290 $57.99
79290 VIEGA
P-PROP-0947 [PROPRESS 2" FEMALE ADAPTER #79370
Each 48077458 $59.99
79370 VIEGA
P-PROP-0948 [PROPRESS 4" COUPLING WITH STOP #20738
Each 450-511P $112.65
20738 VIEGA
P-SPRK-0001 ESCUTCHEONS-VIKING-1/2 CHR-2 PC-ESC-RECESSED-
PART # 06419AF Each 06419AF $2.72
VIKING 06419AF
P-SPRK-0003 (ESCUTCHEONS- SPRINKLER DOME COVER ASSY-EC-
COM-WHT-135F-#12381MA/SW1004 - VIKING Each SW1004 $17.00
VIKING 12381MA/WSW 1004
P-TBAR-0001 T-BAR CARTRIDGE REMOVER FOR WATERLESS URNIALS
#P2-500 *WES7* Each 20401022 $39.28
SLOAN 1001502 TITAN TOOL 12710
P-TRAP-0001 TRAP PRIMER WITH ADJ. SCREWS-
P2-500 *PRECISION PLUMBING* Each P2-500 $79.29
PRECISION PLUMBING P2-500
P-URIN-0001 URINAL-WATERFREE-# F4000-CARTRIDGE FOR THIS # C-
1-M2 TALL C-THIS FITS THE F4000 & F2000 Each 40600019 $53.89
SLOAN 1001555
P-WSUP-0600 (3/8 COMP X 7/8 BALLCOCK NUT X 12 " STAINLESS STEEL
WATER SUPPLY TANK CONNECTOR Each 40800396 LSP PRODUCTS GROUP KWC120- $4.30
*DURA PRO OR EVERFLOW* PP
P-WSUP-0601 [1/2" COMP X 7/8" x 12" STAINLESS STEEL WATER SUPPLY
TANK CONNECTOR #27412-NL Each 40800383 $2.88
“DURA PRO OR EVERFLOW* CSB International S$3-12-T
P-WSUP-0602 (1/2 COMP X 1/2 FIP X 20" STAINLESS STEEL WATER
SUPPLY TANK CONNECTOR *DURA PRO OR EVERFLOW* Each 40800578 $3.94
Crown Industries 163-10120
P-WSUP-0603 (3/8'OD X 1/2 FIP X 20 "STAINLESS STEEL WATER SUPPLY
CONNECTOR #27120-NL *DURA PRO OR EVERFLOW* Each 40800238 $2.82
LSP PRODUCTS SFC-120PP
P-WSUP-0604 [1"T & P 150LB 500,000 BTU PRESSURE RELIEF VALVE ,
AUTOMATIC RESEATING, BRONZE, 40XL 150210 Each 0163725 $229.97
TWATTS™ WATTS 0163725
P-WSUP-0605 (3/4" T & P 150LB 200,000 BTU PRESSURE RELIEF
VALVE,AUTOMATIC RESEATING / 40XL-150210**WATTS** Each 0556016 $140.93
WATTS 0556016
P-WSUP-0606 |3/4 x4" N.P.T- RELIEF VALVE-COATED-THERMOSTAT
ELEMENT-150 PSI/210 TEMP/100,000BTU *WATTS#96551 Each 0556000 $27.75

WATTS 0556000




P-WSUP-0607 |[THERMOMETER ADJ. ANGLE-37923 | AS5H9 Weksler
AS5H942 Each ASFH-9-42 $52.22
WEKSLER ASFH-9-42-AL
P-WSUP-0608 |[THERMOMETER WELL 3/4" - BRASS
Each 56897002 $8.53
WEKSLER 3-4F2
P-WSUP-0609 |T&P RELIEF VALVE,LONG SHAFT, 3/4LLL 40XL -M15, Watts
#150210 Each 163803 $577.80
WATTS 0163803
EACH 40300354 $146.10
P-FAUC-0348  |ZURN 1/4TURN 4" CERAMIC HYD CART ZURN P1321XL-Y-RC
EACH 41031170 $179.00
P-FAUC-0370 _|WILLOUGHBY INDUSTRIES EVK-4 WILLOUGHBY INDUSTRIES EVK
P-BRAD-0008 [BRADLEY IR TMA DUAL VALVE ASSY
Each S45-2570 $542.00
P-BRAD-0009 |BRADLEY IR TL DUAL VALVE ASSY
Each S45-2571 $371.55
P-BRAD-0010  [MULTI-FRONT SENSOR REPAIR KIT 269-1184 WITHOUT
CONNECTORS Each $65-107 $328.10
P-BRAD-0011 |GASKET MF WINDOW TERRAZZO
Each 124-070 $6.33
P-BRAD-0012 [LENS
Each 37085240 $8.35
P-BRAD-0013 |BRADLEY SCREW 1/4-20 X 3/8 SET
Each 160-246 $2.34
P-BRAD-0014 |BRADLEY DIFFUSER
Each 269-508 $7.71
P-BRAD-0015 |BRADLEY STREAMFORMER
Each 115-125 $6.70
P-BRAD-0016  [SEAT GUIDE MTRNG AIR VLV BRADLEY
Each 40120203 $4.85
P-BRAD-0322 |SEE P-FAUC-0322 ON ORIGINAL BID
Each 40120011 NA
P-BATT-0002 |6V BATTERY HOLDER - INTERSAN SENSOR
WASHFOUNTAIN EACH P35064 $25.60
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